
I

T

E

M

Q

T

Y

U

N

I

T

DESCRIPTION Item #

1 60 EA Red Light Confirmation Bulbs

Phillips #10.5 A19 

Slim/2700 Dimmable $4.45 $267.00 $5.44 $326.40 $15.33 $919.80 $4.35 $261.00

2 6 PER 15 PACK 8' Flourescent Lamps/ILSN

Phillips # F96t12/cw/HO-

0/ALTO/15PK $42.30 $253.80 $206.00 $1,236.00 $83.33 $499.98 $41.25 $247.50

3 12 EA ILSN BALLAST 8'

Lighting component 

#EESB-424-13L-8' $73.39 $880.68 $71.19 $854.28 $97.19 $1,166.28 NR NR

4 12 EA ILSN BALLAST 10"

Lighting component 

#EESB-1040-14L-10 $93.23 $1,118.76 $123.69 $1,484.28 $121.49 $1,457.88 NR NR

5 20 EA 480 V PHOTOCELLS Tork #5008M Turnlock $20.55 $411.00 $30.33 $606.60 $21.66 $433.20 $20.65 $413.00

6 20 EA 120/277v photo cells Tork #5007M Turnlock $10.89 $217.80 $9.62 $192.40 $17.12 $342.40 $19.69 $393.80

7 100 EA 10 amp fuses

Ferraz ATQ10 500 V 

Midget Fuse $5.69 $569.00 $4.46 $446.00 $4.03 $403.00 $6.02 $602.00

8 40 EA BUSS Fuseholders HEB-AW-RLC-A $33.05 $1,322.00 $26.00 $1,040.00 $13.49 $539.60 $22.39 $895.60

9 100 EA 175 watt MH Lamps

MVR 175 U Median 

Base BD17 $12.00 $1,200.00 $8.69 $869.00 $7.84 $784.00 $12.35 $1,235.00

10 40 EA 400 W PULSE START LAMP MVR400/U/PA $16.71 $668.40 $11.56 $462.40 $11.68 $467.20 $17.06 $682.40

11 80 EA 400 W MH Lamps MH400/ED37/U/4K $9.67 $773.60 $12.82 $1,025.60 $8.53 $682.40 $9.77 $781.60

12 15 EA KW light pole

RTSU30-7.5-11-BLK-25-

NC-BSC 1.00/SKT $1,634.38 $24,515.70 $1,560.00 $23,400.00 $1,743.33 $26,149.95 $2,120.00 $31,800.00

13 3 EA Sternberg Pole & fixture 

AG670TASRLEDPT/521

4FPS/GAR  C45T3-

MDL05/BK/DBA/GFI-

LPIUC $3,414.74 $10,244.22 $3,414.00 $10,242.00 $3,488.17 $10,464.51 $3,526.00 $10,578.00

14 20 EA GE light fixtures

GE# 

DCF4OE5A1GMC3DBR $542.71 $10,854.20 $541.00 $10,820.00 $560.02 $11,200.40 $566.00 $11,320.00

15 10 EA Hapco light pole

Hapco # 87605P30 

POLE $1,147.37 $11,473.70 $1,148.00 $11,480.00 $762.37 $7,623.70 $1,184.78 $11,847.80

16 10 EA Hapco tranformer Base 

Hapco # 72748P30  

Base $312.64 $3,126.40 $312.63 $3,126.30 $268.82 $2,688.20 $322.82 $3,228.20

17 10 EA GE light fixture tenon

GE# D4TADADB-

R_D180 $443.75 $4,437.50 $449.00 $4,490.00 $463.04 $4,630.40 $463.00 $4,630.00

18 20 EA Breakaway Bolts

Transpo Pole Safe 

#4100 $271.67 $5,433.40 $625.00 $12,500.00 $277.88 $5,557.60 $265.76 $5,315.20

19 1 Per 500 ft. Roll Electrical Wire, #6 Black Stranded

#6 XHHW WIRE BLACK 

STRANDED $170.00 $170.00 $224.91 $224.91 $174.47 $174.47 $221.42 $221.42

20 1 Per 500 ft. Roll Electrical Wire, #6 Red Stranded

#6 XHHW WIRE RED 

STRANDED $170.00 $170.00 $224.91 $224.91 $174.47 $174.47 $221.42 $221.42

21 1 Per 500 ft. Roll #6 Copper Wire

#6 COPPER WIRE 

Stranded Bare $150.00 $150.00 $173.98 $173.98 $125.18 $125.18 $189.05 $189.05

22 30 EA Light Pole Terminal blocks Blackburn #CSB 4-3 S $10.42 $312.60 $10.18 $305.40 $9.31 $279.30 $6.38 $191.40
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23 1500 EA

Phillips Lumec Road Focus Medium 

LED Cobra Head Luminaries, LED 

Module Type III short, 347-480VAC, 

standard dimmable driver 0-10V, 

standard twist-lock Receptacle 5 pin B 

(COLOR BLACK)

RFM-108W48LED4K-T-

R3S-HVU-DMG-RCD-BK $218.16 $327,240.00 $216.00 $324,000.00 $246.95 $370,425.00 $228.00 $342,000.00

24 50 EA

Philllips Lumec Road Focus Medium 

LED Cobra Head Luminaries, LED 

Module Type II short, 347-480VAC, 

standard  dimmable driver  0-10V, 

standard twist-lock receptacle 5 pin 

black finish

RFM-108W48LED4K-T-

R2S-HVU-DMG-RCD-BK $218.16 $10,908.00 $216.00 $10,800.00 $246.95 $12,347.50 $228.00 $11,400.00

25 25 EA

Philllips Lumec Road Focus Medium 

LED Cobra Head Luminaries, LED 

Module Type IV, 347-480VAC, 

standard  dimmable driver  0-10V, 

standard twist-lock receptacle 5 pin 

black finish

RFM-108W48LED4K-T-

R3M-HVU-DMG-RCD-

BK $218.16 $5,454.00 $216.00 $5,400.00 $246.95 $6,173.75 $228.00 $5,700.00

26 50 EA

Philllips Lumec Road Focus Medium 

LED Cobra Head Luminaries, LED 

Module Type III short, 120-277VAC, 

standard  dimmable driver  0-10V, 

standard twist-lock receptacle 5 pin 

black finish

RFM-108W48LED4K-T-

R3S-UNIV-DMG-RCD-B $206.16 $10,308.00 $204.00 $10,200.00 $235.53 $11,776.50 $216.00 $10,800.00

27 0 EA Intermatic K4500 Shorting Cap INT-MAT K4500 no bid $0.00 $3.96 $0.00 $4.28 $0.00 $4.95 $0.00

28 0 EA

Cooper Navion Roadway LED, w/o 

dimming, Type II Cut-off

NVN-AE-02-E-8-T2R-

10K-4N7-K-KB no bid $0.00 $289.22 $0.00 $298.55 $0.00 $302.00 $0.00

29 0 EA

Cooper Navion Roadway LED, w/o 

dimming, Type III Cut-off

NVN-AE-02-E-8-T3R-

10K-4N7-K-BK no bid $0.00 $289.22 $0.00 $298.55 $0.00 $302.00 $0.00

30 0 EA

Cooper Navion Roadway LED, w/o 

dimming, Type IV cut-off

NVN-AE-02-E-8-T4FT-

10K-4N7-K-BK no bid $0.00 $289.22 $0.00 $298.55 $0.00 $302.00 $0.00

TOTAL NET PRICE $432,479.76 $435,930.46 $477,486.67 $454,954.39

ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS BID TAB SHEET.  HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BID ON THIS SHEET SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS A COMMENT ON THE 
RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS SUCH BID AS RESPONSIVE.
THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON COMPLIANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE LAWS. CITY OF FRISCO PURCHASING GUIDELINES, AND PROJECT 
DOCUMENTS, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS.  THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER UPON AWARD OF THE CONTRACT AND, 
ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT TIME.
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